
NOTICE OF RACE 
SNIPE CLASS INTERNATIONAL RACING ASSOCIATION – USA 

Carolyn Nute Memorial Snipe Regatta 
October 31 – November 1, 2015 

ORGANIZING AUTHORITY: Snipe Class International Racing Association – 
USA 

HOSTING CLUB: Mission Bay Yacht Club, SCIRA Fleet 495 

RULES: The current Racing Rules of Sailing (RRS), the SCIRA Rules of Conduct 
for Conducting National and International Championship Regattas, and the Sailing 
Instructions shall be in effect. In case of conflict between the Notice of Race and 
the Sailing Instruction the Sailing Instructions shall prevail. Racing rules 35, 62, 
A2 and Race Signals have been changed in the Sailing Instructions. 

ADVERTISING: This regatta is classified as Category “C” in accordance with the 
RRS and SCIRA Advertising Prescriptions. 

ENTRY AND ELIGIBILITY: This regatta is open to SCIRA registered boats and 
Class Member skippers who are in good standing with SCIRA for the current year 
subject to any Deed of Gift trophy restrictions. 

REGISTRATION: Please Pre-Register (no payment required) here. Formal 
Registration will be available the day of the regatta. The entry fee is $30 and 
includes a regatta gift for all competitors, and social after party. 

SCHEDULE: Saturday, 31 October

Registration 0900 - 1015 Clubhouse

Competitors Meeting 1020 Flag Pole

Warning for Race 1 1200 Bay Race Course

Warning for Race 2 & 3 ASAP Bay Race Course

SCHEDULE: Sunday 1 November

Warning for Race 4 1130 Bay Race Course

Warning for Race 5 & 6 ASAP No Start After 1530



MEASUREMENT: all boats are required to have a current Class decal properly 
displayed. 

SAILING INSTRUCTIONS: the regatta Sailing Instructions will be available 
prior to the start of the regatta at MBYC.org. 

COURSES: the courses to be sailed may be Windward/Leeward, Triangles, 
Olympic, or MBYC Bay Courses. A full course chart will be available in the 
Sailing Instructions. 

BLACK FLAG: RRS Rule 30.3 shall not been used in this regatta. 

SCORING: The regatta shall be scored using RSS Low Point scoring system 
appendix A-2, modified such there will only be a throw-out if 6 races are scored. 

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY: Competitors participate in the regatta entirely at 
their own risk. See rule 4, Decision to Race. The organizing authority will not 
accept any liability for material damage or personal injury or death sustained in 
conjunction with or prior to, during, or after the regatta. 

SOCIAL: Oh yeah! Saturday after sailing social will have a keg on the beach. On 
the water costume contest will be judged on Sunday so come with your best racing 
costume … you don’t want to miss this one! 

REGATTA CONTACT: Seth Siegler 

Award Presentations After racing


